

**OFFICIAL TALLY SHEET
CITY OF NIAGARA FALLS, NEW YORK**

BID # 2021-22 PURCHASE OF TREES II

BID OPENING: September 2, 2021 11:00 A.M.

PAGE 1 OF 1

SET 1 OF 1

| ITEMS (10) | EST. QTY. | DESCRIPTION | Arbor Day Foundation 211 N. 12 th Street Lincoln, NE 68508 | Horticulture Associates of Rochester / We Find Plants PO Box 64932 Rochester, NY 14624 | Schichtel's Nursery, Inc. 7420 Peters Road Springville, NY 14141 | Chestnut Ridge Nursery 225 Crescent Drive Orchard Park, NY 14127 | |
|---------------|--------------|--|---|--|--|--|--|
| 1. | 45 | White Pine (Pinus strobus) | NO BID | \$90.00 | \$92.00 | \$107.00 | |
| 2. | 30 | White Spruce (Picea glauca) | NO BID | \$90.00 | \$92.00 | \$107.00 | |
| 3. | 10 | Sugar Maple (Acer saccharum) | NO BID | \$190.00 | \$125.00 | \$168.00 | |
| 4. | 5 | Sugar Maple – bare root (Acer saccharum) | NO BID | ***\$12.00*** | \$109.00 | \$96.00 | |
| 5. | 11 | American Elm (Ulmus americana) | NO BID | \$190.00 | \$125.00 | \$99.00 | |
| 6. | 5 | American Elm – bare root (Ulmus americana) | NO BID | ***\$16.00*** | \$109.00 | \$74.00 | |
| 7. | 10 | Basswood (Tilia americana) | NO BID | \$190.00 | \$119.00 | \$134.00 | |
| 8. | 5 | Basswood – bare root (Tilia americana) | NO BID | ***\$17.00*** | \$105.00 | \$84.00 | |
| 9. | 5 | Kentucky Coffeetree (Gymnocladus dioicus) | NO BID | \$190.00 | \$134.00 | \$159.00 | |
| 10. | 5 | Kentucky Coffeetree – bare root (Gymnocladus dioicus) | NO BID | ***\$16.00*** | \$127.00 | \$96.00 | |
| | | Estimated Total Expenditure | N/A | \$13,895.00 | 13,635.00 | 14,679.00 | |
| | | NOTES: | ***Exceptions noted by vendor*** | | | | |